

Bid Tabulation Sheet(s)

Board Item #1

**Brookdale Commun
Lincroft Campus**

Bid Category: #16-12, Printing Services

Paper & Envelopes

Date: November 20, 2015

Time: 11 am

Bid Tabulation Sheet

*** Denotes Alternate**

Bidder	WB Mason Co., Inc. Cranbury, NJ	Paper Mart, Inc. East Hanover, NJ	Paterson Card and Paper Co. Paterson, NJ
Bid Security	10% NTE \$20,000 Bid Bond	10% NTE \$20,000 Bid Bond	Cashier's Check \$7,868.84
Item 1	\$5.35/M	\$4.90/M	\$5.25/M
Item 2	\$6.60/M	\$6.89/M	\$7.90/M
Item 3	\$7.28/M	\$7.00/M	\$7.00/M
Item 4	\$16.56/M	\$15.74/M	\$16.50/M
Item 5	\$21.20/M	\$18.85/M	\$19.50/M
Item 6	\$14.90/M	\$13.05/M	\$13.00/M
Item 7	No Bid	\$22.17/M	\$21.50/M
Item 8	\$19.80/M	\$18.64/M	\$18.60/M
Item 9	\$40.00/M	\$36.49/M	\$38.50/M
Item 10	No Bid	\$115.16/M	\$97.00/M
Item 11	\$34.40/M	\$27.25/M	\$24.75/M
Item 12	\$40.32/M	\$31.42/M	\$28.50/M
Item 13	No Bid	\$52.11/Set	\$51.95/Set
Item 14	No Bid	\$88.10/Set	\$87.00/Set
Item 15	No Bid	\$135.40/Set	No Bid
Item 16	No Bid	\$6.84/Box	\$6.70/Box
Item 17	No Bid	\$9.48/Box	\$8.50/Box
Item 18	No Bid	\$20.95/Box	\$19.50/Box
Item 19	No Bid	\$16.15/Box	\$16.00/Box
Item 20	No Bid	\$7.02/Box	\$6.99/Box
Item 21	No Bid	\$7.99/Box	\$8.00/Box
Item 22	No Bid	\$8.75/Box	\$8.75/Box
Item 23	No Bid	\$64.80/Box	No Bid
Item 24	No Bid	\$90.40/Box	\$115.00/Box
Item 25	No Bid	\$7.02/Box	\$6.99/Box
Item 26	\$24.18/CT	\$23.81/CT	\$24.90/CT
Item 27	\$26.39/CT	\$26.37/CT	\$26.20/CT
Item 28	No Bid	\$110.40/M	\$98.00/M
Item 29	\$34.40/M	\$28.11/M	\$31.00/M
Item 30	No Bid	\$95.43/M	\$65.00/M
Item 31	\$51.20/M	\$55.00/M	\$42.50/M